
CHINA Presentation 



Introduction

The main languages of china are 
mandarin and Chinese 

(traditional). 
 The capital city of China is 

Beĳing. 
China is a communist country 
although the government is 
much more lenient the other 

communist countries. 
 China borders North Korea, 

Russia, Nepal and Mongolia etc 
and has 14500 kilometres of 

coastline.



Harbin Ice Festival

• The Sculptures at the festivals 
are made entirely out of ice.


• Millions of people visit the 
festival each year.


• Temperatures can reach -24 
degrees Celsius


• The festival can last until 
March if temperatures are cold 
enough. 







The Provinces

• There are 23 province in China.


• Each province has a 
communist party centre.


• The least populated province 
Quinhai has 5.6 million people.


• The most populated province 
Guandong has 104 million 
people. 



The Great Wall of 
China

• The wall stretches across the 
north of China.


• The official length is 21,196.18 
km


• The Great Wall is more than 
2,300 years old.


• Badaling is the most visited 
section (63,000,000 visitors 
come on average each year). 
And in the first week of May 
and October, the visitor flow 
can be up to 70,000 per day.





The Chinese Panda 

• Panda's in China eat Bamboo.


• The giant panda is native to 
China.


• Panda's are considered good 
luck in China.


• Panda's are an endangered 
species


